
EV 2193

Vendor Criswell Performance Cars Inc   Criswell Chevrolet Inc Criswell Nissan of Germantown Inc   
  1 ($408.00) ($519.00) ($100.00)
  2 ($408.00) ($519.00) ($100.00)
  3 ($408.00) ($519.00) ($100.00)
  4 ($408.00) ($519.00) ($100.00)
  5 ($408.00) ($519.00) NO BID
  6 ($408.00) ($519.00) NO BID
  7 $1,991.00 $1,990.00 $2,000.00
  8 $1,989.00 $1,990.00 $2,000.00
  9 $1,989.00 $1,990.00 $2,000.00
  10 $1,989.00 $1,990.00 $2,000.00
  11 $1,989.00 $1,990.00 $2,000.00
  12 $1,989.00 $1,990.00 $2,000.00

*Didn't bid all lines*

Vendor Criswell Performance  Criswell Ford of Woodstock LLC   Hertrich Fleet Services Inc
Imports Inc

  1 ($225.00) ($390.00) ($501.00)
  2 ($250.00) ($390.00) ($801.00)
  3 ($250.00) ($390.00) ($660.00)
  4 ($250.00) ($390.00) ($590.00)
  5 NO BID ($390.00) ($835.00)
  6 NO BID ($390.00) NO BID
  7 $2,000.00 NO BID NO BID
  8 $2,000.00 NO BID NO BID
  9 $2,000.00 NO BID NO BID
  10 $2,000.00 NO BID NO BID
  11 $2,000.00 NO BID NO BID
  12 $2,000.00 NO BID NO BID

*Didn't bid all lines* *Didn't bid all lines* *Didn't bid all lines*

REQUEST FOR BID NO. B-1560 OPENED 10/16/20 @ 3:00 P.M.
OFF-THE-LOT, NEW AND USED VEHICLES, THROUGH CLASS 7 26000# GVWR



Vendor George R Norris Inc dba   Apple Ford Inc   All Roads Trucks LLC
Norris Ford

  1 $1,494.00 ($895.00) NO BID
  2 $1,194.00 ($1,025.00) NO BID
  3 $1,439.00 ($1,300.00) $1,439.00
  4 $1,694.00 ($1,350.00) $1,439.00
  5 NO BID ($1,450.00) $2,194.00
  6 NO BID ($1,800.00) $2,994.00
  7 NO BID NO BID NO BID
  8 NO BID NO BID NO BID
  9 NO BID NO BID NO BID
  10 NO BID NO BID NO BID
  11 NO BID NO BID NO BID
  12 NO BID NO BID NO BID

*Didn't bid all lines* *Didn't bid all lines* *Didn't bid all lines*


	Sheet1

