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BALTIMORE COUNTY PUBLIC SCHOOLS 
Darryl L. Williams, Ed.D. ⬧ Superintendent ⬧ 6901 North Charles Street ⬧ Towson, MD ⬧ 21204 

 

 
February 16, 2023 

 

All Participating Bidders: 

 

This letter is to inform you that the Baltimore County Public Schools (BCPS) Office of Purchasing will make 

recommendation of award for GDA-312-23 “Safety Shoes”. 

 

The following firms have been selected and are pending approval by the Board of Education of Baltimore County at 

their regularly scheduled board meeting on March 14, 2023. 

 

Red Wing Brands of America Inc. 

Saf-Gard Safety Shoe Co. 

Red Wing, MN 

Greensboro, NC 

 
Upon approval by the Board of Education, BCPS Contracts will contact Award Bidders in regard to contract 

execution.  BCPS Contracts may be contacted via email at contracts@bcps.org for instructions on how to complete 

the required documentation.  Insurance certificates and signed contract must be received before a Purchase Order 

can be issued.  Awarded firm(s) who have not done business with BCPS prior to this award, must register on the 

BCPS “Vendor Self-Service” (VSS), as instructed below. 

 
Type the following into your browser: http://businessservices.bcps.org/departments/fiscal_services/purchasing/vendors 

Click the link: “Proceed to Vendor Self Service” 

Select “New Vendor Registration Guide: for detailed instructions.  Print these instructions for reference, and then return 

to the VSS welcome page. 

Click onto “Register” from the VSS welcome page and follow the instruction you have printed. 

Complete the application. Record your UserID and Password for future use. 
 

Thank you for participating in this procurement and for your interest in partnering with BCPS.  We support and 

encourage your participation in future BCPS projects.  If you have any questions concerning this notification, please 

contact me at gdagraca@bcps.org.  

 

Sincerely, 

 

Gabriel da Graca  
 
Gabriel da Graca  

Sr. Purchasing Agent, Office of Purchasing  

Baltimore County Public Schools  

 

 

c:   Cristina Blasetti, Manager, Facilities Grounds 

 Contracts@bcps.org 

Bid file 
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Red Wing Brands of America Inc Saf-Gard Safety Shoe Co.

Shoes For Crews, LLC

Non-Responsible

ITEMS Brand / Product Line

Vendor Quotation "% off list 

price"

Vendor Quotation "% 

off list price" Vendor Quotation "% off list price"

1 Bates NO BID 20.00%

2 Carolina NO BID 22.50%

3 Carhartt Boots NO BID 10.00%

4 Dr.  Martens NO BID 20.00%

5 Georgia Boot NO BID 16.00%

6 Hytest NO BID 22.50%

7 Irish Setter Work 17.00% NO BID

8 Keen Utility NO BID 13.75%

9 Lehigh Safety Shoes NO BID NO BID

10 Red Wing Brand 17.00% NO BID

11 Reebok NO BID 22.50%

12 Rocky NO BID 16.00%

13 Skechers WORK footwear NO BID 22.50%

14 SR Max NO BID 22.50%

15 Thorogood NO BID 20.75%

16 Timberland Pro NO BID 17.50%

17 Weinbrenner NO BID 20.75%

18 Wolverine NO BID 20.00%

19 WORX 17.00% NO BID

20

All Other Brands Within Vendor 

Catalog NO BID 22.50%

21

Accessories purchased by 

employee 17.00% 22.50%

BALTIMORE COUNTY PUBLIC SCHOOLS

BID TABULATION

GDA-312-23 

SAFETY SHOES

IMPORTANT:  NO AWARD HAS BEEN MADE.

Award bidder (s) has not yet been identified.   Complete evaluation of the bids by BCPS representatives will occur in the near future.  The recommended 

award will be available in the Office of Purchasing after the completed evaluation.  Bids will not be available for review by bidders at the bid opening.  

BCPS reserves the right to review all materials and present a recommendation to the Board of Education prior to bids being available for review.  Bid 

documents will only be available for review after approval of the contract by the Board.   Bidders may call the Office of Purchasing to set up a date and 

time for reviewing bid documents.


