
Red Wing Brands of 

America Inc Saf-Gard Safety Shoe Co. Shoes For Crews, LLC

ITEMS Brand / Product Line

Vendor Quotation "% off 

list price"

Vendor Quotation "% off 

list price"

Vendor Quotation "% off 

list price"

1 Bates NO BID 20.00% NO BID

2 Carolina NO BID 22.50% 30.00%
3 Carhartt Boots NO BID 10.00% NO BID
4 Dr.  Martens NO BID 20.00% NO BID
5 Georgia Boot NO BID 16.00% NO BID
6 Hytest NO BID 22.50% NO BID
7 Irish Setter Work 17.00% NO BID NO BID
8 Keen Utility NO BID 13.75% NO BID
9 Lehigh Safety Shoes NO BID NO BID NO BID

10 Red Wing Brand 17.00% NO BID NO BID

11 Reebok NO BID 22.50% 30.00%
12 Rocky NO BID 16.00% NO BID

13 Skechers WORK footwear NO BID 22.50% NO BID

14 SR Max NO BID 22.50% NO BID

15 Thorogood NO BID 20.75% NO BID
16 Timberland Pro NO BID 17.50% NO BID

17 Weinbrenner NO BID 20.75% NO BID
18 Wolverine NO BID 20.00% NO BID
19 WORX 17.00% NO BID NO BID

20

All Other Brands Within Vendor 

Catalog NO BID 22.50% 30.00%

21

Accessories purchased by 

employee 17.00% 22.50% 30.00%

BALTIMORE COUNTY PUBLIC SCHOOLS

BID TABULATION

GDA-312-23 

SAFETY SHOES

IMPORTANT:  NO AWARD HAS BEEN MADE.

Award bidder (s) has not yet been identified.   Complete evaluation of the bids by BCPS representatives will occur in the near future.  

The recommended award will be available in the Office of Purchasing after the completed evaluation.  Bids will not be available for 

review by bidders at the bid opening.  BCPS reserves the right to review all materials and present a recommendation to the Board of 

Education prior to bids being available for review.  Bid documents will only be available for review after approval of the contract by the 

Board.   Bidders may call the Office of Purchasing to set up a date and time for reviewing bid documents.


