18CM-144 Grass Seed and Fertilizer

Company Chesapeake Valley Seed | Crop Production Services Landscape Supply Inc. Maryland Plant & Supply inc. Newsom Seed Inc. Site One Landscape Supply
Item Qty | Unit price Total price Unit price Total price Unit price Total price Unit price Total price Unit price Total price Unit price Total price
Item #1A 24-0-0 SCU 501b,
bags 1,100 $20.47 mwm‘m“_.q.oo $13.40 mwhhbo.oo $12.82 muh.now.oo No Bid No Bid $12.50| 513,750.00 No Bid No Bid
ltem #2A Maryland Certified
50Ib. bags 400 $68.75| $27,500.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $115.39 $46,156.00 $69.00| %27,600.00 No Bid No Bid
Item #3A Oregon {blue tag)
Fescue Mix 50Ib bags
400 $67.26 $26,900.00 $64.00 $25,600.00 $61.00| $24,400.00 $113.47 $45,388.00 $64.00] 525,600.00 No Bid No Bid
Hem #44 Dolomitic Palletized
Limestone 501b. Bags
400 $6.35 $2,540.00 $3.95 $1,580.00 34.86 $1,944.00 $5.19 $2,076.00 $4.95 51,950.00 $4.59 $1,836.00
Item #5A Solu Cal - Standard
Grade 501k bags 20 $14.00 $280.00 *Rejected $11.89 $237.80 No Bid No Bid $11.85 $239.00 *Rejected
e #5A 21-0-0 Ammanium
Sulfate 50ib bags
80 No Bid No Bid $9.75 $585.00 $9.89 $593.40 $13.46 $807.60 $8.186 $489.00 $10.33 $619.80
Itern #7A Bermuda Grass:
Riviera 25lb. Bags 30 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $280.00 $8,400.00 $480.00 $14,400.00 $300.00 $9,000.00 $332.85 $9,985.50
Item #7 A Bermuda Grass:
Savannah 25lb bags 15 Na Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $228.50 $3,427.50 Na Big No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Item #8A Transitional/Annual
Panterra 50ib. bags
190 $43.75 $8,312.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $71.15 $13,518.50 $43.50 $8,265.00 No Bid No Bid
ltem #9A
TranstionailAnnual Ryegrass
50 Ib. bags Breakoud
800 *Rejected No Bid No Bid $44.50| $26,700.00 $73.38 $44,028.00 $45.50] $27,300.00 No Bid No Bid
ltem #10A 0-0-7 with .20%
Merritt 50Ib. bags 400 No Bid No Bid $13.85 $5,540.00 $14.53 $5,812.00 No Bid No Bid $14.95 $5,980.00 $14.37 $5,748.00
e #114 46-0-0 Urea
Fertilizer 50Ib, bags 300 $20.23 $6,065.00 $11.50 $3,450.00 $13.45 %4,035.00 $17.69 $5,307.00 $11.95 $3,585.00 $13.23 $3,969.00
Itern #12A 0-0-50 Sulfate of
Potash Fertilizer 50lb. bags
200 $26.94 $5,388.00 $20.85 $4,170.00 $20.34 $4,068.00 $29.80 $5,960.00 $20.95 $4,190.00 52447 $4,894.00
Item #13A 0-0-7 with 087
Acelepryn 50lb. bags 400 No Bid No Bid $22.05 $8,820.00 $23.00] 59,200.00 $43.62 $17,448.00 $25.95| $10,380.00 $25.76 $10,304.00
ltem #14A 0-0-7 with .86%
Pre M 50lb. bags 400 No Bid No Bid No Bid Na Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $12.50 $5,000.00 314.21 $5,684.00
hem #15A 0-0-7 with .38%
Prodiamine 50Ib. bags 400 No Bid No Bid $9.95 $3,980.00 $9.94 $3,976.00 $17.50 $7,000.00 $11.25 $4,500.00 311.89 54,756.00
ltem #16A Field Conditioner,
Turface MVP 50Ib, bags Or
AACPS Approved Equivalent
400 No Bid No Bid $12.50 $5,000.00 $8.63 $3,452.00 $15.39 $6,156.00 $8.85 $3,540.00 Ne Bid No Bid
terrd##17A Field Conditioner,
Turface Quick
50lb. bags Or AACPS
Approved Equivalent
400 No Bid No Bid $13.50 $5,400.00 $8.63 $3,452.00 $15.39 $6,156.00 $8.85 $3,540.00 No Bid Na Bid
Itern #18A Lebanon Proscape
20-0-5;30 Mesa w/1% lron
50lb. bags Or AACFS
Approved Equivalent
500 Na Bid No Bid *Rejected $14.14 $7,070.00 $30.23 $15,115.00 $13.65 $6,825.00 $14.45 $7,225.00




18CM-144 Grass Seed and Fertilizer

Newsom Seed Inc.

Site One Landscape Supply

Company Chesapeake Valley Seed | Crop Production Services Landscape Supply Inc. Maryland Plant & Supply Inc.

ftem #19A Growmark
24-0-12;25% xcu 50lb, bags
QOr AACPS Approved
Equivalent

500 $14.90|  $7,450.00 $12.60 $6,300.00 $13.19]  $5,595.00 $20.23 $10,115.00 $13.45]  $6,725.00 No Bid No Bid
Iltem #20A Lebanon
ProScape 32-0-6;30% Mesa
50 Ib. bags
Or AACPS Approved
Equivalent

500 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $18.41 $9,205.00 $22.23 $11,115.00 $18.95 $9,475.00 $19.04 $9,520.00
item #21A Apex 10 - Humic
Acid/2,5 Gallon Containers

10 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $75.00 $750.00 $157.70 $1,577.00 $100.00 $1,000.00 *Rejected

Total $25,690.00 $88,068.30 $61,929.00
Total 1A-21A for 3 years $77,070.00 $264,204.90 $185,787.00




