
ITEM / DESCRIPTION 22nd Century Technologies, Inc. Abacus Corporation Applied Technology Services Appmor, LLC A P Ventures, LLC

ITEM 1: “BASE HOURLY RATE” FOR BUSINESS 
INTELLIGENCE REPORTING 
ANALYST/DEVELOPER:

$90.00 $112.00 No Bid $123.20 $135.00

ITEM 2: “BASE HOURLY RATE” FOR MS 
EXCHANGE ENGINEER: $85.00 $93.00 $85.00 $108.41 $95.00

ITEM 3: “BASE HOURLY RATE” FOR 
ENTERPRISE SYSTEMS ENGINEER: $85.00 $102.00 $85.00 $138.00 $130.00

ITEM 4: “BASE HOURLY RATE” FOR FIELD 
NETWORK TECHNICIAN: $45.00 $47.00 $65.00 $72.00 $80.00

ITEM 5: “BASE HOURLY RATE” FOR SYSTEM 
ARCHITECT: $105.00 $102.00 No Bid $141.00 $130.00

ITEM 6: “BASE HOURLY RATE” FOR 
APPLICATIONS DEVELOPER (C# .NET): $95.00 $102.00 $80.00 $98.60 $97.00

ITEM 7: “BASE HOURLY RATE” FOR 
APPLICATIONS DEVELOPER (JAVA): $95.00 $94.00 No Bid $109.00 $85.00

ITEM 8: “BASE HOURLY RATE” FOR SQL 
SERVER DBA: $89.00 $94.00 $80.00 $112.00 $115.00

ITEM 9: “BASE HOURLY RATE” FOR IT BUSINESS 
SYSTEMS ANALYST / PROJECT MANAGER: $110.00 $94.00 $90.00 $88.70 $119.00

ITEM 10: “BASE HOURLY RATE” FOR QUALITY 
ASSURANCE TESTER: $80.00 $68.00 No Bid $73.95 $70.00

ITEM 11: “BASE HOURLY RATE” FOR COGNOS/ 
DEVELOPER: $90.00 $119.00 No Bid $93.00 $85.00

ITEM 12: “BASE HOURLY RATE” FOR DATA 
WAREHOUSE DEVELOPER: $100.00 $119.00 No Bid $138.00 $135.00

ITEM 13: “BASE HOURLY RATE” FOR VISUAL 
BASIC DEVELOPER: $80.00 $60.00 $60.00 $98.60 $95.00

CONTRACTED INFORMATION TECHNOLOGY STAFFING SERVICES 
for Baltimore County Public Schools 

Solicitation Number JMI-623-13 
POSTING 



ArcSoft Consulting Ardent Technologies, Inc. Artisys Corporation ASK Staffing, Inc. Advanced Software Systems, Inc. (ASSYST) AttivaSoft, LLC Attronica

$125.00 $75.00 $69.00 $94.80 $75.00 $90.00

$105.00 No Bid $69.00 $73.90 $75.00 $90.00

$116.00 No Bid $145.00 $82.10 $75.00 $91.33 $105.00

$60.00 No Bid $42.00 $34.75 $55.00 $68.51 $90.00

$175.00 $70.00 $145.00 $109.60 $90.00 $110.00

$95.00 $67.00 $73.00 $91.50 $78.00 $90.00

$105.00 $67.00 $80.00 $91.50 $78.00 $109.61 $95.00

$110.00 $65.00 $90.00 $84.75 $80.00 $95.00

$105.00 $70.00 $75.00 $98.55 $90.00 $118.75 $90.00

$75.00 $60.00 $69.00 $71.20 $65.00 $80.00

$120.00 $67.00 $69.00 $114.64 $80.00 $85.00

$135.00 $67.00 $75.00 $114.64 $80.00 $85.00

$95.00 $60.00 $70.00 $65.00 $80.00



Avani Technology Solutions Inc. ClarusTec, Inc. CNC Consulting, Inc. The Cognitos Group, LLC Conviso, Inc. Coolsoft, LLC DataNetworks DEVCARE SOLUTIONS

$75.00 $79.00 $75.00 $85.00 $80.00 $117.00 $75.00

$82.00 $100.00 $76.00 $130.00

$82.00 $115.00 $81.00 $80.00 $130.00 $72.00

$59.00 $55.00 $65.00 $62.00 $69.00

$89.00 $94.00 $100.00 $90.00 $95.00 $126.00

$71.00 $69.00 $75.00 $78.00 $80.00 $121.00 $70.00

$70.00 $69.00 $75.00 $87.00 $85.00 $121.00 $78.00

$69.00 $79.00 $75.00 $81.00 $85.00 $106.00 $75.00

$72.00 $84.00 $75.00 $90.00 $79.00 $95.00 $131.00 $95.00

$68.00 $69.00 $75.00 $70.00 $75.00 $112.00 $70.00

$78.00 $69.00 $75.00 $75.00 $120.00 $72.00

$78.00 $74.00 $75.00 $74.00 $80.00 $123.00 $78.00

$61.00 $64.00 $75.00 $65.00 $75.00 $112.00 $72.00



Dynamix Corporation E-CONSULTING, INC. Elegant Enterprise Wide Solutions, Inc. Engineering Technology Associates, Inc. E-Rate Elite Services, Inc.

$80.00 $120.00 $85.00 $82.00

$100.00 $80.00 $68.00

$75.00 $125.00 $75.00 $74.00

$50.00 $89.00 $50.00 $58.00

$125.00 $85.00 $84.00

$60.00 $110.00 $75.00 $68.00

$120.00 $75.00 $65.00

$115.00 $80.00 $63.00

$75.00 $140.00 $100.00 $72.00 $150.00

$50.00 $110.00 $75.00 $56.00

$65.00 $120.00 $75.00 $65.00

$140.00 $95.00 $72.00

$105.00 $65.00 $64.00



Freedom Telecom Services, LLC Gnet LLC Government Works, Inc INFOJINI, INC Irvine Technology Corporation JuneGem Technologies, Inc.

$151.20 $80.00 $90.00 $100.00 $88.00

$140.00 $85.00 $88.00 $90.00 $75.00

$168.00 $85.00 $95.00 $90.00 $75.00

$112.00 $80.00 $78.00 $60.00 $35.00 $75.00

$156.80 $89.00 $98.00 $125.00 $90.00 $120.00

$106.40 $85.00 $85.00 $85.00 $75.00

$106.40 $85.00 $85.00 $95.00 $75.00 $75.00

$145.60 $80.00 $82.00 $90.00 $82.00

$134.40 $95.00 $110.00 $100.00 $70.00 $135.00

$95.20 $80.00 $82.00 $78.00 $60.00 $75.00

$123.20 $85.00 $73.00 $110.00 $88.00

$134.40 $80.00 $80.00 $110.00 $82.00

$100.80 $80.00 $62.00 $85.00 $70.00



Kennedy Personnel Services Knowlogy Corporation Magothy Technology, LLC Makro Technologies Inc. Mindlance Inc. Nodavare Corporation

$64.00 $216.00 $84.00 $65.00 $84.00 $95.00

$73.00 $192.00 $78.00 $79.00

$75.00 $276.00 $78.00 $82.00

$42.00 $57.76 $67.00 $39.00 $69.00

$84.00 $300.00 $84.00 $81.90 $92.00 $95.00

$74.00 $210.00 $84.00 $65.00 $79.00 $80.00

$76.00 $240.00 $65.00 $86.00 $80.00

$72.00 $192.00 $80.00 $65.00 $82.00 $80.00

$81.00 $228.00 $103.00 $67.00 $81.00 $75.00

$42.00 $52.00 $75.00 $58.50 $74.00 $65.00

$70.00 $60.62 $84.00 $65.00 $79.00 $95.00

$69.00 $240.00 $85.00 $67.60 $78.00 $95.00

$66.00 $192.00 $85.00 $65.00 $69.00 $80.00



Realistic Computing, Inc. R/O Resource Solutions SERIGOR INC Sigman & Summerfield Associates, Inc. Software Consortium Software People Inc.

$65.00 $75.00 $95.00 $76.00 $118.00 $110.00

$52.76 $84.50 $125.00 $79.00 $135.00 $95.00

$78.23 $95.00 $105.00 $68.00 $135.00 $110.00

$46.00 $72.00 $45.00 $120.00 $75.00

$105.00 $125.00 $125.00 $90.00 $135.00 $125.00

$66.90 $82.00 $95.00 $78.00 $115.00 $85.00

$76.74 $82.00 $95.00 $83.00 $119.00 $95.00

$79.20 $74.00 $95.00 $80.00 $94.00 $90.00

$73.04 $105.00 $130.00 $80.00 $125.00 $95.00

$66.90 $71.00 $90.00 $65.00 $115.00 $75.00

$81.56 $82.00 $110.00 $65.00 $110.00 $95.00

$84.23 $82.00 $110.00 $65.00 $120.00 $95.00

$67.34 $74.50 $95.00 $65.00 $85.00 $75.00



SONA Networks, LLC SunPlus Data Group, Inc. Swift Staffing Technotrack Systems, LLC Tidal Technoligies Corporation Trigyn Technologies, Inc. 

$115.00 $85.00 $55.65 $75.00 $85.00

$100.00 $70.00 $47.85 $79.50 $80.00

$100.00 $88.00 $74.06 $79.50 $85.00

$75.00 $50.00 $35.00 $63.00 $50.00

$110.00 $100.00 $61.82 $120.00 $92.00 $95.00

$110.00 $75.00 $53.91 $76.00 $75.00

$130.00 $78.00 $57.86 $90.00 $81.00 $80.00

$115.00 $90.00 $53.62 $83.25 $80.00

$125.00 $100.00 $62.48 $105.00 $75.00 $95.00

$110.00 $70.00 $60.77 $75.00 $67.00 $65.00

$120.00 $90.00 $59.57 $79.50 $75.00

$130.00 $95.00 $56.18 $77.00 $85.00

$115.00 $70.00 $58.56 $71.00 $65.00



Trilogy Technical Services, LLC United Solutions, LLC UVS InfoTech LLC. VDART Inc.

$98.00 $95.00 $120.00 $65.00

$93.00 $95.00 $115.00 $65.00

$98.00 $110.00 $120.00 $70.00

$68.00 $80.00 $115.00 $58.00

$105.00 $125.00 $155.00 $75.00

$101.00 $105.00 $105.00 $65.00

$105.00 $100.00 $115.00 $67.00

$101.00 $115.00 $145.00 $68.00

$112.00 $125.00 $145.00 $75.00

$88.00 $85.00 $105.00 $55.00

$93.00 $110.00 $125.00 $65.00

$98.00 $125.00 $115.00 $60.00

$93.00 $85.00 $105.00 $62.00
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