BALTIMORE COUNTY PUBLIC SCHOOLS
BID TABULATION - POSTING

Bid Number: MBU-508-14
Bid Name: PURCHASE OF MODULAR CLASSROOMS

Bidders’ Names
Mobile Modular |- Modular Genius . EMH
Environmental

Base Bid
ITEM #1: SINGLE CLASSROOM UNIT No Bid $59,162.00 $55,895.00
ITEM #2: SINGLE CLASSROOM UNIT No Bid $55,507.00 $55,166.00
ITEM #3: SINGLE CLASSROOM UNIT No Bid $62,391.00 $56,510.00
ITEM #4: SINGLE CLASSROOM UNIT No Bid $58,810.00 $56,276.00
ITEM #5: DOUBLE CLASSROOM UNIT No Bid $97,700.00 $100,885.00
ITEM #6: DOUBLE CLASSROOM UNIT No Bid $92,674.00 $94,294.00
ITEM #7: DOUBLE CLASSROOM UNIT No Bid $103,447.00 $102,155.00
ITEM #8: DOUBLE CLASSROOM UNIT No Bid $98,533.00 $100,301.00
Alternate #1: Purchase Price for ong complete ADA No Bid
approved, Aluminum Porch with Stairs, at 30" above grade: $2,170.00 $1,867.00
Alternate #2: Purchase Price for one complete, ADA B
approved, Aluminum Porch, at 30" above grade, with Ramp No Bid
{30 feet long) for SINGLE classroom unit: $6,670.00 $6,543.00
Alternate #3: Purchase Price for one complete, ADA
approved, Aluminum Porch, at 30° above grade, with Ramp No Bid
(30 feet fong) for DOUBLE classroom unit: $8,250.00 $8,065.00
Alternate #4: Purchase Price for one complete ADA
approved, Wood/Composite, Porch with Stairs at 30" above No Bid
grade: $1,530.00 $1,355.00
Alternate #5: Purchase Price for one complete, ADA
approved, Wood / Composite Porch, at 30° above grade, with No Bid
Ramp (30 feet long) for a SINGLE classroom unit: $4,080.00 $5,067.00
Alternate #6: Purchase Price for gne complete, ADA
approved, Wood / Composite Porch, at 30° above grade, with No Bid
Ramp (30 feet long) for a DOUBLE classroom unit: $4,860.00 $5,730.00
Alternate #7: Purchase Price for one set of Skirting for . .
Single Unit; with Vents: No Bid $1,725.00 $1,485.00
Alternate #8: Purchase Price for one set of Skirting for. |
Double Unit: with Vents: No Bid $2,550.00 $2,261.00
Alternate #9: Purchase Price a Set of Dry Block Foundation .
Piers for Single Unit; on 24" x 24" ABS pads: No Bid $1,110.00 $5646.00
Alternate #10: Purchase Price a Set of Dry Block Foundation .
Piers for Double Unit; on 24" x 24° ABS pads: No Bid $1,620.00 $765.00
Alternate #11: Price for ONE Concrete Foundation Footer
24" diameter x 32” deep; dug and installed, inspected and wet No Bid
stack, solid CMU Foundation pier, 16 x 16 x 48 high: $300.00 $350.00
Alternate #12: Price for Rigging and Set-up on site for Single B R
Unit: No Bid $2,420,00 $2,800.00
Alternate #13: Price for Rigging and Set-up on site for ,
Double Unit: No Bid $3,090.00 $3,500.00
Alternate #14: 1/2" thick viny! finished drywall instead of the .
regular 1/2" drywall specified for a Single No Bid -$500.00 $200.00
Alternate #15: 1/2" thick vinyl finished drywall instead of the |
regular 1/2" drywall specified for a Double ’ No Bid -$1,000.00 $400.00
Alternate #16: Regular Hourly Rate for Journeyman Plumber No Bid $41.40 $85.00
Alternate #17: Regularly Hourly Rate to Apprentice Plumber . No Bid $38.20 $66.00
Alternate #18: Regular Hourly Rate for Journeyman N
Electrician No Bid $54.50 $82.00
Alternate #19: Regular Hourly Rate for Apprentice Electrician No Bid $38.60 $65.00
Alternate #20; Regular Hourly Rate for HVAC Technician No Bid $54.54 $120.00
Alternate #21: Regular Hourly Rate for Laborer / Helper No Bid $38.20 $62.00
1.1 Lavatory Facilities: Provide the cost per square foot :
for the addition of Lavatory Facilities, No Bid $53.25 ) $72.73
1.2 Lead Time: THE TIME BETWEEN THE PLACEMENT
OF AN ORDER AND DELIVERY No Bid 60 days 50 days
1.1 PERCENTAGE MARK-UP / MARK-DOWN on R
MATERIALS (not to exceed 20%) No Bid 20.00% , 20.00%

Total For Award 0.00 $667,407.89 $662,978.93
Note(s):

IMPORTANT: NO AWARD HAS BEEN MADE.

Award bidder {s) has not yet been identified. Compiete evaluation of the bids by BCPS representatives will occurin the near future. The
recommended award will be available in the Office of Purchasing after the completed evaluation. Bids will not be available for review by
bidders at the bid opening. BCPS reserves the right to review all materials and present a recommendation to the Board of Education
prior to bids being available for review. Bid documents will only be available for review after approval of the contract by the Board.
Bidders may call the Office of Purchasing to set up a date and time for reviewing bid documents.




