
GROUP 1:  HOURLY LABOR RATES
Advanced Fire 

Protection 
Systems, LLC

ARK Systems Inc. Johnson Controls 
Inc. Starlight Security

T.L.Gardens and 
Associates Inc. 
dba Life Safety 

Solutions

ITEM 1A: “REGULAR HOURLY LABOR RATE” for 
one (1) Certified Technician: $70.00 $65.83 $133.00 $120.00 $95.00 

ITEM 1B:
“REGULAR HOURLY LABOR RATE – 
OFF HOURS” for one (1) Certified 
Technician:

$70.00 $81.15 $199.50 $175.00 $142.50 

ITEM 1C:
“HOLIDAY HOURS AND/OR DOUBLE 
TIME RATE" for one (1) Certified 
Technician:

$80.00 $120.72 $266.00 $210.00 $142.50 

ITEM 1D: "MATERIAL MARK-UP PERCENTAGE 20% 56% 15% 20% 20%

ITEM 1E: "SUB-CONTRACTOR MARK-UP 
PERCENTAGE" 10% 20% 15% 25% 20%

GROUP 2:  FIRE ALARM SYSTEMS 
(EQUIPMENT, HARDWARE, PARTS 
AND ACCESSORIES)

ITEM 2A: Provide "percentage off list" discount 
pricing for Edwards: 20% 25% 0% 0% 20%

ITEM 2B: Provide "percentage off list" discount 
pricing for Fire-Lite Alarms: 20% 25% 0% 5% 0%

ITEM 2C: Provide "percentage off list" discount 
pricing for Fire Mark: 20% 0% 0% 0% 0%

ITEM 2D: Provide "percentage off list" discount 
pricing for IBM: 20% 0% 0% 0% 0%

ITEM 2E: Provide "percentage off list" discount 
pricing for Pittway Corporation: 20% 0% 0% 5% 0%

ITEM 2F: Provide "percentage off list" discount 
pricing for Pyrotronics: 20% 0% 0% 5% 0%

ITEM 2G: Provide "percentage off list" discount 
pricing for Silent Knight: 20% 10% 0% 5% 0%
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ITEM 2H: Provide "percentage off list" discount 
pricing for SimplexGrinnell: 20% 0% 30% 5% 0%

GROUP 3:  MISCELLANEOUS 
EQUIPMENT, HARDWARE, PARTS 
AND ACCESSORIES FOR FIRE 
ALARM SYSTEMS

ITEM 3A: Provide "percentage off list" discount 
pricing for DITEK Corporation: 20% 0% 0% 5% 0%

ITEM 3B: Provide "percentage off list" discount 
pricing for Fireline Corporation: 10% 0% 0% 0% 0%

ITEM 3C: Provide "percentage off list" discount 
pricing for Gentec: 20% 25% 15% 0% 0%

ITEM 3D: Provide "percentage off list" discount 
pricing for Honeywell: 20% 0% 0% 5% 0%

ITEM 3E:
Provide "percentage off list" discount 
pricing for Safety Technology 
International:

20% 10% 0% 0% 0%

ITEM 3F: Provide "percentage off list" discount 
pricing for System Sensor: 20% 20% 15% 5% 0%

ITEM 3G: Provide "percentage off list" discount 
pricing for Test-Um: 20% 0% 0% 0% 0%

ITEM 3H: Provide "percentage off list" discount 
pricing for Wheelock: 20% 25% 15% 5% 0%

IMPORTANT:  NO AWARD HAS BEEN MADE. 

Award bidder(s) has not yet been identified.   Complete evaluation of the bids by BCPS representatives will occur in the near future.

Any recommendation of award must be approved by the Board of Education of Baltimore County.



PRICE PROPOSAL FOR CCPS 
REQUIREMENTS

Advanced Fire 
Protection 

Systems, LLC
ARK Systems Inc. Johnson Controls 

Inc. Starlight Security

Unit Pricing
Back flow certification $300.00 $145.00 No Bid No Bid
Replacement Pressure gauge $80.00 $23.00 $25.00 No Bid

Pressure Gauge verification unit price $50.00 $123.00 $17.00 No Bid

3 inch gauges
Compound gauge $120.00 $75.00 $110.00 No Bid
Air gauge $80.00 $40.00 $30.00 No Bid
Water gauge $80.00 $40.00 $30.00 No Bid

 
Hood Systems
Price per hood system test per unit $350.00 $175.00 $228.00 No Bid
Price per Pyro Chem cartridge $200.00 $220.00 $52.00 No Bid
Sprinkler Inspection

Price to perform quarterly sprinkler test 
as specified and listed per quarter $600.00 $750.00 $250.00 No Bid

Perform Annual Fire Pump
Price per test per pump $500.00 $750.00 $825.00 No Bid
Standpipe Inspection Test
Price standpipe test $800.00 $250.00 $228.00 No Bid

Semi-Annual Halon Fire Detection 
and Suppression Test System

Price per system test per unit $400.00 $475.00 $684.00 No Bid

Fire Extinquisher Inspections, 
Testing, Maintenance and Hydro
Annual fire extinguisher inspection per 
unit each $5.00 $4.00 $5.00 No Bid

Six year maintenance inspections 5 lb. 
ABC per unit each $30.00 $19.00 $37.00 No Bid

Six year maintenance inspections 10 lb. 
ABC per unit each $30.00 $29.00 $50.00 No Bid

Hydro and recharge 5 lb. ABC per unit 
each $45.00 $29.64 $44.00 No Bid

Hydro and recharge 10 lb. ABC per unit 
each $55.00 $45.24 $59.00 No Bid

Hydro and recharge 5 lb. CO2 per unit 
each $45.00 $67.08 $56.00 No Bid

Hydro and recharge 10 lb. CO2 per unit 
each $55.00 $71.76 $64.00 No Bid

Baltimore County Public Schools - Office of Purchasin

BID POSTING

KSH-340-18  FIRE ALARM SYSTEM INSTALLATIONS, REPAIRS, PARTS, INSPECT



Hydro and recharge 15 lb. CO2 per unit 
each $60.00 $76.44 $70.00 No Bid

                                                                

IMPORTANT:  NO AWARD HAS BEEN MADE. 

Award bidder(s) has not yet been identified.   Complete evaluation of the bids by BCPS repr
future.

Any recommendation of award must be approved by the Board of Education of Baltimore Co



T.L.Gardens and 
Associates Inc. 
dba Life Safety 

Solutions
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Advanced Fire 
Protection 

Systems, LLC
ARK Systems

School / Facility Name
1 Arbutus Elementary 1,200.00$                957.60$              
2 Arbutus Bus, Grounds and Mnt Facility 1,200.00$                119.70$              
3 Arbutus Middle 1,200.00$                957.60$              
4 Baltimore Highlands Elementary 1,200.00$                538.66$              
5 Battle Grove Elementary 1,200.00$                651.74$              
6 Battle Monument Elementary 1,200.00$                520.35$              
7 Bear Creek Elementary 1,200.00$                667.20$              
8 Bedford Elementary 1,200.00$                239.40$              
9 Berkshire Elementary 1,200.00$                239.40$              
10 Campfield Early Childhood Center 1,200.00$                520.35$              
11 Carney Elementary 1,200.00$                957.60$              
12 Carroll Manor Elementary 1,200.00$                359.10$              
13 Carver Center for Arts & Technology 1,200.00$                2,394.00$           
14 Catonsville Administration Building 1,200.00$                832.00$              
15 Catonsville Center for Alternative Studies 1,200.00$                732.00$              
16 Catonsville Elementary 1,200.00$                957.60$              
17 Catonsville High 3,000.00$                3,351.60$           
18 Catonsville Middle 1,200.00$                984.22$              
19 Cedarmere Elementary 1,200.00$                971.45$              
20 Chadwick Elementary 1,200.00$                984.22$              
21 Chapel Hill Elementary 1,200.00$                1,452.60$           
22 Charlesmont Elementary 1,200.00$                569.26$              
23 Chase Elementary 1,200.00$                598.50$              
24 Chatsworth School Elementary 1,200.00$                957.60$              
25 Chesapeake High 3,000.00$                1,675.80$           
26 Chesapeake Terrace Elementary 1,200.00$                478.80$              
27 Church Lane Technology Elementary 1,200.00$                329.18$              
28 Cockeysville Food Service Wharehouse 1,200.00$                474.36$              
29 Cockeysville Grounds & Service Center 1,200.00$                552.90$              
30 Cockeysville Middle 1,200.00$                718.20$              
31 Colgate Elementary 1,200.00$                359.10$              
32 Cromwell Valley Regional Magnet Elementary 1,200.00$                445.58$              
33 Crossroads Center 1,200.00$                300.00$              
34 Deep Creek Elementary 1,200.00$                957.60$              
35 Deep Creek Middle 1,200.00$                658.36$              
36 Deer Park Elementary 1,200.00$                538.66$              
37 Deer Park Middle 1,200.00$                957.60$              
38 Dogwood Elementary 1,200.00$                732.00$              
39 Dulaney High 3,000.00$                3,290.00$           
40 Dumbarton Middle 1,200.00$                1,490.00$           



41 Dundalk and Sollers Point High Schools 3,000.00$                6,251.80$           
42 Dundalk Elementary 1,200.00$                957.60$              
43 Dundalk Middle 1,200.00$                1,915.20$           
44 Eastern Technical High 3,000.00$                2,544.52$           
45 Edgemere Elementary 1,200.00$                957.60$              
46 Edmondson Heights Elementary 1,200.00$                1,057.60$           
47 Elmwood Elementary 1,200.00$                732.00$              
48 Essex Elementary 1,200.00$                837.90$              
49 Featherbed Lane Elementary 1,200.00$                478.80$              
50 Fifth District Elementary 1,200.00$                418.96$              
51 Fort Garrison Elementary 1,200.00$                957.60$              
52 Franklin Elementary 1,200.00$                299.26$              
53 Franklin High 3,000.00$                3,290.00$           
54 Franklin Middle 1,200.00$                3,159.45$           
55 Fullerton Elementary 1,200.00$                478.80$              
56 General John Stricker Middle 1,200.00$                1,490.00$           
57 George Washington Carver Center 1,200.00$                3,291.90$           
58 Glenmar Elementary 1,200.00$                418.96$              
59 Glyndon Elementary 1,200.00$                957.60$              
60 Golden Ring Middle 1,200.00$                2,626.82$           
61 Grange Elementary 1,200.00$                763.66$              
62 Greenwood - A Building 1,200.00$                179.56$              
63 Greenwood - B Building 1,200.00$                897.76$              
64 Greenwood - C Building 1,200.00$                658.36$              
65 Greenwood - D Building 1,200.00$                299.26$              
66 Greenwood - E Building 1,200.00$                957.60$              
67 Gunpowder Elementary 1,200.00$                598.50$              
68 Halethorpe Elementary 1,200.00$                478.80$              
69 Halstead Academy Elementary 1,200.00$                239.40$              
70 Hampton Elementary 1,200.00$                598.50$              
71 Harford Hills Elementary 1,200.00$                239.40$              
72 Hawthorne Elementary 1,200.00$                1,137.16$           
73 Hebbville Elementary 1,200.00$                732.00$              
74 Hereford High 3,000.00$                2,513.72$           
75 Hereford Middle 1,200.00$                1,490.00$           
76 Hernwood Elementary 1,200.00$                957.60$              
77 Hillcrest Elementary 1,200.00$                598.50$              
78 Holabird Middle 1,200.00$                505.42$              
79 Home and Hospital Center 1,200.00$                300.00$              
80 Hopkins Creek Bus Facility 1,200.00$                179.56$              
81 Jacksonville Elementary 1,200.00$                732.00$              
82 Johnnycake Elementary 1,200.00$                478.80$              
83 Joppa View Elementary 1,200.00$                957.60$              
84 Kenwood Administration Offices 1,200.00$                300.00$              



85 Kenwood Bus Facility 1,200.00$                179.56$              
86 Kenwood High 3,000.00$                3,588.00$           
87 Kingsville Elementary 1,200.00$                209.48$              
88 Lansdowne Elementary 1,200.00$                732.00$              
89 Lansdowne High 3,000.00$                3,704.10$           
90 Lansdowne Middle 1,200.00$                1,915.20$           
91 Loch Raven High 3,000.00$                2,992.50$           
92 Loch Raven Technical Academy Middle 1,200.00$                957.60$              
93 Logan Elementary 1,200.00$                418.96$              
94 Lutherville Laboratory Elementary 1,200.00$                329.48$              
95 Lyons Mill ES 1,200.00$                1,915.20$           
96 Maiden Choice School Special 1,200.00$                373.36$              
97 Mars Estates Elementary 1,200.00$                299.26$              
98 Martin Boulevard Elementary 1,200.00$                1,137.16$           
99 Mays Chapel ES 1,200.00$                1,675.80$           
100 McCormick Elementary 1,200.00$                538.80$              
101 Meadowood Education Center Middle 1,200.00$                732.00$              
102 Middle River Middle 1,200.00$                984.22$              
103 Middleborough Elementary 1,200.00$                299.26$              
104 Middlesex Elementary 1,200.00$                299.26$              
105 Milbrook Elementary 1,200.00$                625.14$              
106 Milford Mill Academy High 3,000.00$                3,290.00$           
107 New Town Elementary 1,200.00$                1,924.61$           
108 New Town High 3,000.00$                2,992.50$           
109 North Point Ground and Maintenence Facility 1,200.00$                275.00$              
110  Northwest Academy of Health Sciences 1,200.00$                1,490.00$           
111 Norwood Elementary 1,200.00$                1,197.00$           
112 Oakleigh Elementary 1,200.00$                373.36$              
113 Oliver Beach Elementary 1,200.00$                598.50$              
114 Orems Elementary 1,200.00$                433.20$              
115 Overlea High 2,000.00$                3,290.00$           
116 Owings Mills Elementary 1,200.00$                734.49$              
117 Owings Mills High 3,000.00$                1,942.90$           
118 Padonia International Elementary 1,200.00$                957.60$              
119 Parkville High 3,000.00$                2,872.80$           
120 Parkville Middle 1,200.00$                1,915.20$           
121 Patapsco High 2,000.00$                3,351.60$           
122 Perry Hall Elementary 1,200.00$                957.60$              
123 Perry Hall High 3,000.00$                3,290.00$           
124 Perry Hall Middle 1,200.00$                1,915.20$           
125 Pikesville High 3,000.00$                4,290.00$           
126 Pikesville Middle 1,200.00$                1,958.21$           
127 Pine Grove Elementary 1,200.00$                493.06$              
128 Pine Grove Middle 1,200.00$                3,710.70$           



129 Pinewood Elementary 1,200.00$                732.00$              
130 Pleasant Plains Elementary 1,200.00$                957.60$              
131 Pot Spring Elementary 1,200.00$                239.40$              
132 Powhatan Elementary 1,200.00$                478.80$              
133 Prettyboy Elementary 1,200.00$                718.20$              
134 Providence Road Bus Facility 1,200.00$                300.00$              
135 Pulaski Park Office - 9600 Suite 118 1,200.00$                119.70$              
136 Pulaski Park Office - 9610 Suite 201 to 214 1,200.00$                119.70$              
137 Pulaski Park Office – 9610 Suite 215 to 216 1,200.00$                119.70$              
138 Pulaski Park Office - 9610 Suite 217 to 221 1,200.00$                119.70$              
139 Pulaski Park Office – 9611 Suite 301 1,200.00$                299.26$              
140 Pulaski Park Office - 9611 Suite 305 1,200.00$                119.70$              
141 Pulaski Park Office – 9611 Suite 307 1,200.00$                119.70$              
142 Randallstown Elementary 1,200.00$                359.10$              
143 Randallstown High 2,000.00$                1,945.42$           
144 Red House Run Elementary 1,200.00$                418.96$              
145 Reisterstown Elementary 1,200.00$                718.22$              
146 Relay Elementary 1,200.00$                359.10$              
147 Riderwood Elementary 1,200.00$                788.06$              
148 Ridge Ruxton School 1,200.00$                373.36$              
149 Ridgely Middle 1,200.00$                893.30$              
150 Riverview Elementary 1,200.00$                478.80$              
151 Rodgers Forge Elementary 1,200.00$                1,010.84$           
152 Rosedale Bus Facility 1,200.00$                300.00$              
153 Rosedale Center - Middle and High 1,200.00$                418.96$              
154 Sandalwood Elementary 1,200.00$                732.00$              
155 Sandy Plains Elementary 1,200.00$                418.96$              
156 Scotts Branch Elementary 1,200.00$                732.00$              
157 Seneca Elementary 1,200.00$                598.50$              
158 Seven Oaks Elementary 1,200.00$                478.80$              
159 Seventh District Elementary 1,200.00$                987.82$              
160 Shady Spring Elementary 1,200.00$                957.60$              
161 Southwest Academy Middle 1,200.00$                1,941.82$           
162 Sparks Elementary 1,200.00$                498.82$              
163 Sparrows Point High and Middle 3,000.00$                1,955.13$           
164 Stemmers Run Middle 1,200.00$                1,490.00$           
165 Stoneleigh Elementary 1,200.00$                1,675.80$           
166 Sudbrook Magnet Middle 1,200.00$                658.36$              
167 Summit Park Elementary 1,200.00$                658.36$              
168 Sussex Elementary 1,200.00$                373.36$              
169 Timber Grove Elementary 1,200.00$                628.52$              
170 Timonium Elementary 1,200.00$                239.40$              
171 Towson High 3,000.00$                3,439.96$           
172 Victory Villa Elemenrary 1,200.00$                1,200.00$           



173 Villa Cresta Elementary 1,200.00$                1,466.54$           
174 Vincent Farm Elementary 1,200.00$                3,485.15$           
175 Wabash Bus Facility 1,200.00$                239.40$              
176 Warren Elementary 1,200.00$                478.80$              
177 Wellwood International Elementary 1,200.00$                612.76$              
178 West Towson Elementary 1,200.00$                1,915.20$           
179 Westchester Elementary 1,200.00$                957.60$              
180 Western School of Technology High 2,000.00$                3,112.22$           
181 Westowne Elementary 1,200.00$                732.00$              
182 White Oak School 1,200.00$                957.60$              
183 Winand Elementary 1,200.00$                492.65$              
184 Windsor Mill Middle School 1,200.00$                3,621.82$           
185 Winfield Elementary 1,200.00$                732.00$              
186 Woodbridge Elementary 1,200.00$                359.10$              
187 Woodholme Elementary 1,200.00$                1,915.20$           
188 Woodlawn High 2,000.00$                3,873.92$           
189 Woodlawn Middle 1,200.00$                718.20$              
190 Woodmoor Elementary 1,200.00$                478.80$              

PM Total 264,400.00$         211,869.04$     





Johnson Controls 
Inc.

 Starlight 
Security 

T.L. Gardens 
and Associates 

Inc. dba Life 
Safety Solutions

 
1,200.00$                2,500.00$        No Bid
1,500.00$                2,500.00$        No Bid
2,500.00$                2,500.00$        No Bid
1,500.00$                2,500.00$        No Bid
1,500.00$                2,500.00$        No Bid
1,000.00$                2,500.00$        No Bid

 $               1,500.00 2,500.00$        No Bid
 $               1,000.00 2,500.00$        No Bid
 $               1,500.00 2,500.00$        No Bid
 $               1,000.00 2,500.00$        857.28$              
 $               1,500.00 2,500.00$        No Bid
 $               1,500.00 2,500.00$        No Bid
 $               1,000.00 2,500.00$        No Bid
 $               1,000.00 2,500.00$        No Bid
 $               1,500.00 2,500.00$        857.28$              
 $               1,000.00 2,500.00$        No Bid
 $               3,000.00 2,500.00$        No Bid
 $               1,500.00 2,500.00$        No Bid
 $               1,500.00 2,500.00$        No Bid
 $               1,000.00 2,500.00$        642.96$              
 $               1,500.00 2,500.00$        No Bid
 $               1,500.00 2,500.00$        No Bid
 $               1,000.00 2,500.00$        No Bid
 $               1,500.00 2,500.00$        No Bid
 $               3,000.00 2,500.00$        No Bid
 $               1,000.00 2,500.00$        No Bid
 $               1,500.00 2,500.00$        No Bid
 $               1,000.00 2,500.00$        No Bid
 $               1,000.00 2,500.00$        No Bid
 $               2,500.00 2,500.00$        No Bid
 $               1,000.00 2,500.00$        No Bid
 $               1,500.00 2,500.00$        No Bid
 $               1,000.00 2,500.00$        642.96$              

1,000.00$                2,500.00$        No Bid
2,000.00$                2,500.00$        No Bid
1,500.00$                2,500.00$        No Bid
2,000.00$                2,500.00$        No Bid
1,500.00$                2,500.00$        642.96$              
3,000.00$                2,500.00$        1,714.56$           
2,000.00$                2,500.00$        No Bid



3,000.00$                2,500.00$        No Bid
1,500.00$                2,500.00$        No Bid
2,000.00$                2,500.00$        No Bid
2,500.00$                2,500.00$        No Bid
1,500.00$                2,500.00$        No Bid
1,500.00$                2,500.00$        No Bid
1,500.00$                2,500.00$        642.96$              
1,500.00$                2,500.00$        No Bid
1,500.00$                2,500.00$        No Bid
1,000.00$                2,500.00$        No Bid
1,500.00$                2,500.00$        No Bid
1,500.00$                2,500.00$        No Bid
2,500.00$                2,500.00$        1,714.56$           
2,000.00$                2,500.00$        No Bid
1,500.00$                2,500.00$        No Bid
2,500.00$                2,500.00$        857.28$              
3,000.00$                2,500.00$        No Bid
1,500.00$                2,500.00$        No Bid
1,500.00$                2,500.00$        No Bid
2,000.00$                2,500.00$        No Bid
1,500.00$                2,500.00$        No Bid
1,000.00$                2,500.00$        No Bid
1,000.00$                2,500.00$        No Bid
1,000.00$                2,500.00$        No Bid
1,000.00$                2,500.00$        No Bid
1,000.00$                2,500.00$        No Bid
1,500.00$                2,500.00$        No Bid
1,000.00$                2,500.00$        No Bid

 $               1,500.00 2,500.00$        No Bid
 $               1,500.00 2,500.00$        No Bid
 $               1,000.00 2,500.00$        No Bid
 $               1,500.00 2,500.00$        No Bid
 $               1,500.00 2,500.00$        642.96$              
 $               3,500.00 2,500.00$        No Bid
 $               2,000.00 2,500.00$        857.28$              
 $               1,500.00 2,500.00$        No Bid
 $               1,500.00 2,500.00$        No Bid
 $               2,500.00 2,500.00$        No Bid
 $               1,000.00 2,500.00$        857.28$              
 $               1,000.00 2,500.00$        No Bid
 $               1,500.00 2,500.00$        No Bid
 $               1,500.00 2,500.00$        No Bid
 $               1,500.00 2,500.00$        No Bid
 $               1,000.00 2,500.00$        No Bid



 $               1,000.00 2,500.00$        No Bid
 $               3,500.00 2,500.00$        No Bid
 $               1,000.00 2,500.00$        No Bid
 $               1,500.00 2,500.00$        No Bid
 $               2,000.00 2,500.00$        No Bid
 $               2,000.00 2,500.00$        No Bid
 $               2,500.00 2,500.00$        No Bid
 $               2,000.00 2,500.00$        No Bid
 $               1,500.00 2,500.00$        No Bid
 $               1,500.00 2,500.00$        No Bid
 $               1,500.00 2,500.00$        No Bid
 $               1,500.00 2,500.00$        No Bid
 $               1,500.00 2,500.00$        No Bid
 $               1,000.00 2,500.00$        No Bid
 $               1,500.00 2,500.00$        No Bid
 $               1,000.00 2,500.00$        No Bid
 $               1,000.00 2,500.00$        857.28$              
 $               2,000.00 2,500.00$        No Bid
 $               1,000.00 2,500.00$        No Bid
 $               1,500.00 2,500.00$        No Bid
 $               1,000.00 2,500.00$        No Bid
 $               3,000.00 2,500.00$        1,714.56$           

1,500.00$                2,500.00$        No Bid
2,500.00$                2,500.00$        No Bid
1,000.00$                2,500.00$        No Bid
1,000.00$                2,500.00$        No Bid
1,500.00$                2,500.00$        No Bid
1,000.00$                2,500.00$        No Bid
1,000.00$                2,500.00$        No Bid
1,500.00$                2,500.00$        No Bid
2,000.00$                2,500.00$        No Bid
1,500.00$                2,500.00$        No Bid
2,500.00$                2,500.00$        No Bid
1,000.00$                2,500.00$        No Bid
2,500.00$                2,500.00$        No Bid
2,500.00$                2,500.00$        No Bid
3,000.00$                2,500.00$        No Bid
1,500.00$                2,500.00$        No Bid
3,000.00$                2,500.00$        No Bid
1,500.00$                2,500.00$        No Bid
2,000.00$                2,500.00$        1,714.56$           
2,500.00$                2,500.00$        No Bid
2,500.00$                2,500.00$        No Bid
2,500.00$                2,500.00$        No Bid



1,500.00$                2,500.00$        No Bid
1,500.00$                2,500.00$        No Bid
1,500.00$                2,500.00$        No Bid
1,000.00$                2,500.00$        No Bid
1,500.00$                2,500.00$        No Bid
1,000.00$                2,500.00$        No Bid
1,000.00$                2,500.00$        No Bid
1,000.00$                2,500.00$        No Bid
1,000.00$                2,500.00$        No Bid
1,000.00$                2,500.00$        No Bid
1,000.00$                2,500.00$        No Bid
1,000.00$                2,500.00$        No Bid
1,000.00$                2,500.00$        No Bid

 $               1,000.00 2,500.00$        No Bid
 $               2,500.00 2,500.00$        No Bid
 $               1,500.00 2,500.00$        No Bid
 $               1,000.00 2,500.00$        No Bid
 $               1,000.00 2,500.00$        No Bid
 $               1,500.00 2,500.00$        No Bid
 $               1,500.00 2,500.00$        No Bid
 $               2,000.00 2,500.00$        No Bid
 $               1,500.00 2,500.00$        No Bid
 $               1,500.00 2,500.00$        No Bid
 $               1,000.00 2,500.00$        No Bid
 $               3,000.00 2,500.00$        No Bid
 $               1,500.00 2,500.00$        642.96$              
 $               1,500.00 2,500.00$        No Bid
 $               1,500.00 2,500.00$        642.96$              
 $               1,000.00 2,500.00$        No Bid
 $               1,500.00 2,500.00$        No Bid
 $               1,500.00 2,500.00$        No Bid
 $               1,500.00 2,500.00$        No Bid
 $               2,500.00 2,500.00$        No Bid
 $               1,000.00 2,500.00$        No Bid
 $               2,500.00 2,500.00$        No Bid
 $               2,500.00 2,500.00$        857.28$              
 $               1,500.00 2,500.00$        No Bid
 $               2,000.00 2,500.00$        No Bid
 $               1,500.00 2,500.00$        No Bid
 $               1,500.00 2,500.00$        No Bid
 $               1,500.00 2,500.00$        No Bid
 $               1,500.00 2,500.00$        No Bid
 $               3,000.00 2,500.00$        No Bid
 $               1,000.00 2,500.00$        No Bid



 $               1,500.00 2,500.00$        No Bid
 $               1,500.00 2,500.00$        No Bid
 $               1,000.00 2,500.00$        No Bid
 $               1,000.00 2,500.00$        No Bid
 $               1,000.00 2,500.00$        No Bid
 $               1,500.00 2,500.00$        No Bid
 $               1,500.00 2,500.00$        No Bid

3,000.00$                2,500.00$        No Bid
1,500.00$                2,500.00$        No Bid
1,500.00$                2,500.00$        No Bid
1,500.00$                2,500.00$        No Bid
2,000.00$                2,500.00$        No Bid
1,000.00$                2,500.00$        642.96$              
1,000.00$                2,500.00$        No Bid
1,500.00$                2,500.00$        No Bid
2,500.00$                2,500.00$        No Bid
1,500.00$                2,500.00$        No Bid
1,500.00$                2,500.00$        No Bid

476,269.04$         475,000.00$    18,002.88$         


